3L . €Y MRS F. SSHTa/gie-303/THIIRI 000

mferpd 9eTe

THAR, ARTY 30, 000/IAUEHT §, IH R]R

e GFer WA BIEe BRUTTE] U1 AP IS IS HHiE R .

| HIAT Th-cl
(@) Mefie fae sffrem o 4ad efie a9y sfafs giacds
(T TP, AR-3, FAR-4 A AR-F AR g Dorew AfERE, A2 7
fare giafafta) sfeRg@en, snew g Fare.

ge, Sl g SR faur
H1erd, Hqad goo 032, f&AH 30 AEW 000

IfrgE
HREM fAfFEm, aue.

i THTHL. 90,3000/3RE/HITIR-8.—BRE AT, 98¢ (R8¢ a1 3TN (TR

AR ST S ARFRE ¢ T SR FRVIN Sl ) A Fer & F NE-BA
(9) =1 Ee (3) M BT 99R I TSI ROTE ST St RiE SfoT Ot aEdrd HENE

SRR T FROTRIT 96 T4 ARBRIE AR $99 HERTS A, TgR RER BRE
frrm, aqe3 HE) ATUTE) RN SRUATAIS! et R e 1. @ Fovar s arfafarrean
T 99y I MTIE SFFIH G T HOAT el SR

WY -3 (x¥%3)




<6 HERTS NG T, SR, AR 30, 2000/3WETI0 Q, I 9]32 | MM TH-T

. 1 YA 9ERTE SREF (GE RN FrgE, 3000 3R =T,

R ERTS GRE W, RE3 (UK IR ST Soord iR e Rua sTere
31 are g A, —

(or) lre-fRrem (9) Hel+ rer T TRV T A ¢ T FOR S SR
Ugel ; -

(3) dre-FEE (R mmwgamw q‘raaﬁ“mﬂmmaaﬁ TEITY " B AR
SREE B0 A5,

3 e e ¢ e —

(o) e (9) = o ey oIS @I BT AR T TR
() - (2) e —

(va) @@(m)nw"mqﬁ\"mwﬁa@“maﬁ"awmwm
&,

- (@F) mmﬁa@g(a)m %ﬁwa&"mnmﬁmﬁ qEas w
HOER RIS HROATT Usel,

g, g@ﬁwmﬁhsmmsﬁmaﬁ?awq@r arE Y A ASTERRIGS 8l
BT AGR TR BROTR AT,

HERTSETH I[RIUTe Jiea] JRIER 9 -,

| M. 9. ek,




T UFH-3]  WERTS ¥R NI909, SRR, AR 30, 000/SRIBMT ], TH 9933 43

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,
the following translation in English of the Government Notification,
Industries, Energy and Labour Department, No. FAC. 10,2000/(396)/

Lab-4, dated the 30th November 2000,‘Extraordinary Gazette is hereby

published under authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

AMITABH JOSHI,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

INDUSTRIES, ENERGY AND LABOUR DEPARTMENT
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated the 30th November 2000
NOTIFICATION
» Facrories Acr, 1948. ‘

No. FAC. 10,2000/(396)/LAB-4.—In exercise of the powers conferred by
clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section 6 of the Factories Act, 1948 (LXIII
of 1948), (hereinafter referred to as the “ said Act ”) read with section 112
of the said Act, and of all other powers enabling it in that behalf, the
Government of Maharashtra hereby makes the following rules further to
amend the Maharashtra Factories Rules, 1963, the same having been
previously published as required by section 115 of the said Act, namely:—

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Factories (Second
Amendment) Rules, 2000, ’

2. In rule 5 of the Maharashtra Factories Rules, 15563 (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal rules ”),— E




Y HERTR IR IAUS, SRR, AR 30, 2000/3RE K, IRb 9Q37 | W UG-§
(a) in sub-rule (1), for the words “ five years ” the words “ ten years”
shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-rule (2), in the second proviso, for the words “five years”
the words “ten years ” shall be substituted.

3. 1in rule 8 of the principal rules,—

(@) in sub-rule (1), for the words “five years ” the words “ ten years ?
shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-rule (2),—

(i) in clause (@), for the words “ five years ” the words “ ten years ”
shall be substituted ;

(i) in clause (b), in the second proviso, for the words “three
years ” the words “ten years ” shall be substituted.

4. In Form 3 appended to the principal rules, in entry 5-A, for the
words “ five vears ” the words “ ten years ” shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

S. J. SHASTRI,
Desk Officer.

e e HSOTeTd, Has

~




